Hargana Gouernment Gazette

EXTRAORDINARY
Published by Authority

© Govt. of Haryana

No. 38-2019/Ext.] CHANDIGARH, TUESDAY, FEBRUARY 26, 2019 (PHALGUNA 7, 1940 SAKA)

HARYANA VIDHAN SABHA SECRETARIAT
Notification
The 26th February, 2019

No. 17-HLA of 2019/21/4131.— The Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and
Infrastructure Deficient Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) Amendment Bill, 2019, is hereby
published for general information under proviso to Rule 128 of the Rules of Procedure and Conduct
of Business in the Haryana Legislative Assembly :-

Bill No. 17- HLA of 2019

THE HARYANA MANAGEMENT OF CIVIC AMENITIES AND INFRASTRUCTURE
DEFICIENT MUNICIPAL AREAS (SPECIAL PROVISIONS) AMENDMENT BILL, 2019

A
BILL

further to amend the Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and Infrastructure Deficient
Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) Act, 2016.

Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Haryana in the Seventieth Year of the
Republic of India as follows:-

1. (1)  This Act may be called the Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and Shorttitle and
Infrastructure Deficient Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) Amendment Act, 2019. commencement.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force with effect from the 21st April, 2016.

2. In section 4 of the Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and Infrastructure Deficient ~Amendment of

. : c ol section 4 of
Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) Act, 2016,- Haryana Act 14

(1) in sub-section (1), for the words “three years”, the words “four years” shall be of2016.
substituted; and

(il))  in sub-section (2), for the words “three years”, the words “four years” shall be
substituted.

©11)



912 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 26, 2019 (PHGN. 7, 1940 SAKA)

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

The Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and Infrastructure Deficient Municipal Areas (Special
Provision) Act, 2016 was enacted to identify those areas falling within Municipal Limits where construction has taken
place on more than fifty percent plots prior to 31st March, 2015 to declare such areas as the Civic Amenities and
Infrastructure Deficient Municipal Areas to provide Civic Amenities and Infrastructure in such Areas. In this Act
under section 4 “Enforcement to be kept in Abeyance” was for a period of one year which was upto 20.04.2017. The
department took following action within the validity period of one year.

a. Issued guidelines to seek proposal from municipalities vide letter dated 10.7.2015

b. Circulated the procedure vide memo dated 16.09.2016, 18.11.2016 and 26.12.2016 (which were kept on
hold vide memo dated 08.08.2017).

c. Issued Development Charges vide order dated 04.10.2016. (which were kept on hold vide memo dated
21.10.2016).

Since, action regarding declaration of unauthorized colonies could not be completed within one year, therefore
further an amendment in the Act was brought extending the time limits from “one year” to “two years” vide
notification dated 23.11.2017, the said Act was valid till 20.04.2018.

a. Thereafter proposals received from various municipalities were examined. Out of the proposal of total
982 colonies of 80 municipalities, 528 colonies were been found eligible.

b. 15 colonies of MC, Gurugram and 9 colonies of MC Faridabad were notified vide notification dated
06.12.2017 under the Act.

In the meanwhile action regarding declaration of unauthorized colonies could not be completed within two
years, therefore another amendment in the Act was brought extending the time limits from “two year” to “three years”
vide notification dated 19.04.2018. As per the said amendment, the Act is valid till 20.04.2019:-

a. Thereafter 17 colonies of Municipal corporation Gurugram and Faridabad, 343 colonies of other
Municipal Corporations, 106 colonies of Municipal Councils and 181 colonies of Municipal
Committees have been notified till date

b. Development Charges have been issued vide order dated 27.09.2018.

All actions pertaining to declaration of colonies is to be completed within the validity period, but considering
that some colonies are yet to be notified which likely will take time more than the valid period specified in the
Act,hence, it is required to extend the period stated in the section 4 of the Act for completion of the process. It is,
therefore, proposed that in section 4 (1) and (2) of the Act the words “three years” may be substituted by the words
“four years” so that one more year may be made available to declare areas as the Civic Amenities and Infrastructure
Deficient Municipal Areas.

KAVITA JAIN,
Urban Local Bodies Minister, Haryana.

Chandigarh: R. K. NANDAL,
The 26th February, 2019. Secretary.



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 26, 2019 (PHGN. 7, 1940 SAKA)

913

[ c § ;

2019 &1 fI9I® GEAT 17-TdoTcloVo
AT TRUIfe®T &3 # oqol AMRe GEgfaersl T sawsa &1 YauT
(farery Sudr) e faSEw, 2019
BRI TR &3l § 1qel ArRe gargfaemsii qern seae
BT yaue (fa9iy Susw) ==, 2016,
BT AN WA I & oy
EEpEg

YR TTORTST & ORd a9 § sRImm sy faumHved grr fa=foRad wu # a8
rfrfrafaa 8 —

1. (1) ¥z ffe sRaon TRUfoer &3 d uel ARTRe  gegfduns o
JIERTAT BT Yo (fa9ry Suder) HemeE IifSf=H, 2019, B8 I A 2 |

(2) I 21 37U, 2016, W AT T3 FHSM QT |
2. BRIm TRUferadT el # orgul ANTRe gEgfawunsii e sawve w1 gdue (AR
Iu&e) AfRAFTRH, 2016 DI GRT 4 H—

() SU-ERT (1) # 99 99 TE & WHE R, IR qy” v gfovenfud fag

SITGET; @I
(ii) ;q;ﬁw @) # 99 9 v=l B W W, ‘IR 99 e ufovenfud fay
|

<fered A qer
URHT |

2016 T BRATOM
afafH 14 @
&RT 4 BT
RNIESH



914 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 26, 2019 (PHGN. 7, 1940 SAKA)

Sl Ud BRI &1 faaxor
BRI TRUTferaT J1qul &=l # ANTRS GE—Gfaemeil der auve & v (e Suew) if¥frm
2016 UTfeTd AMMR 3§ U+ alel 99 & Bl ygard & ford AAFHMAT fBar wam o 8l 31.32015 4 @
50 Ufcrerd Wil Wi A ST gaT @ B ANTRG GE—Jaumll T JawRad U BR & ford 39 &3l
B ANREG FE—JAUTAT T ATHEEAT YT TRUIIBT &3 aivd B Ser 21 39 AR & ary 4
“gac SRR I’ U 99 B dy & oy off, ST 20.04.2017 T o | $9 fIMET T U ATl @ dodl &
IR # ffoiRaa & 6 T

. TRUIfIGRI I URdTd UId B & {10 9= fedid 10.7.2015 g1 fezn—facer o fhy v

W, 39 ufehar &I sue A 16.09.2016, 18.11.2016 TAT 26.12.2016 §RT uRarfera fhar wr (R @
o+ feHid 08.08.2017 §RT b T &1 TTS) |

T AR fIHA® 04.102016 ERT b Yo N1 By 7y, (B W @09 {316 21.102016 & gRT
A% oM & TS ) |

fh g Bl oI \if¥d & &I Ufhar T Are d gof T80 81 |1, sdferg A 4 vah
AT BT AT BT IT AT BT ARG MG Qb 23.11.2017 GRT AT TAT o7 | IURIGKT SREA B deran
faTie 20.04.2018 T ol |

F. TS SWId I H Ulferdl AR & FRrd U ANRSG JE—Jagnell qer awar gl
TRUTDT &3 & Ad BI UfhAT AR B ol | oI 982 DIANTI S UK 80 TRUNABIS A
Tt g3 &, T 9 528 URdTE AR U T |

. I 15 DIANTAT TAT BRASEIE DI 9 BidAAl B XS ST & raia srfergaeT s
L
06.12.2017 g} (‘ﬂaﬁ o far |

39 99, IFfaGd Bl @ GO & W H BRae a9 & e} [ A8 B S |ahl, $Hferg
M H e iR HYEA dRA g WA AT BT QT a9 ¥ AW 9y, AfAEr fRAd 19.04.2018 BRI
JSTIT AT | I AT & AR AIIH &7 20.04.2019 TH 9T 7 |

F. THB 96 TR A, THUM SR BAGEE B 17 DA, 3 TR A B 343 HicAR,
TRURYGT BT 106 DA 3R TRUMADIS BT 181 DAl DI ST db O fbar T
gl

@ faie 27.09.2018 BT fAFH Yoo N frd T T |

DI BT G0N | FERIT T HRATS TUar Faf & ™R G4 DI S 8, <ifdhd I8 d 8¢ b
B DA BT 3 T SfeRg(e 1 fbar Tar 8, fo=H arfaifergs # ffde Qo safdr 3 a1 ww o,
sfey Ufehar &1 OR1 $31 & forg ifdfras @ aRT 4§ IR w9 S@afd & ggr ST 7 | o U8 URATad &
5 39 ARFH & IFART 4(1) AT 4(2) # Wl T A", BT YRl IR A’ A I8 AT I AlfB WA
Wﬂsﬁﬁwﬁmwgﬁmﬁamwwwwmwmzﬁ%ﬁwmw
IUAET BRAMIT ST AP AT 3 &3 H Hord Gfaumd U™ &1 ST | |

Pfaar o,
IEN WM A6 w13,
R |
TSNS 3Ro do Aiad,
feHT® 26 WRET, 2019. qfera |

56902—H.V.S.—H.G.P.,Chd.



